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Estimated Cost:
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aWorkshopmis  ST¥) B T2
BIK 3 Pionesr RA hpab #0!-14
Insured:
Policy No. -
Claims No. -
Sum Insured: Excess

(Client's Record)
Make of Veh: (g in mmy”

(Policy Condition)
Remark: The veh had commenced its
repair at the time of inspection.
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BS /DUN / EXNOVA | GY / FS | LIZA | MIC / OHTSU / PIR [ SUMI/
TOYO/YOKO or

Ingrd

Eront Rear

R/Bal. C - RBa. mm
UBat.__—vz—— mm L/Bal. T_—mm
D.OA. DOl / JE: Z‘Z@.-
Survey held at S,“ﬁ Wa 7. L8

Des. of Damages@(iﬁ}ar ] OIS | NIS | UIC | Rooftop or

Date: Person Contacted: The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affected due to collision.
Date / Time Action / Instruction
f’”"fl Wl) u*zf‘m/ LA ﬂ: %of-u :

lump sum $4950, 9 days

red: 5467.19; 52%

Date/Time, File Pass o?

:I Preli. Report
1} j: Final Report

DatelTime, File Return [o?

2) Add Fee:

Fopgph ol ©

Lupup S/ R O3

4950 \

Days Of Repair: 9
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3/5/2020 Merimen e-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

=

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING ]
Case Motified Est Submitted Ad] Assigned |Adj Rpt Ad] Submittad Ins Auth'ed Status

i Main 03 Mar 2020 ?g:T:r 220 New Assignment

| g ; 1 Cancel Case

L . | _Assign |

Reference Claim Details i Documents Show All [

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by insurer]
Insured:
Main

S. K. ROSENBAUER PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No,:

GBB4101G Date of Loss: |27/02/2020 07:00 - :59

TP / SNM20D201082C02 ﬁ‘;‘é:‘fr{lg"_"“ DMPCSN30177219044

| SKEB951X f&'é?fn?ﬁé): B28862437MKC

Excess: 5$500.00
Sng Ah Tee Motor & Panel Service Pte Ltd (Pioneer) Blk 3 Pioneer Road North, #01-18, 628457 Pioneer - Tel: 6268 6183

China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6389 6111 ... [Handled by Adeline Chng Pei WGI'II]

% MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +65 6827 7888

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Final Rpt due 13/03/2020]
survey revert

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

There are no mail for this case.

View All § Compose Case Mail 1

|| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKSE View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task [ Complete

Due Pate Priority  Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No results.,

red: 5467.19

https:ﬂsingapore.merimen.com,-'clalmslindex.cfm?fusebox=MTRad}uster&fuseaction=dsp_clmheader&caseid=922024&extid=333252&CF|D=6319. ~ 12




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 5:58 PM

To: assignments

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Janice Chang

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D201082/SKE8951X/ADELINE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR

CLIENT'S VEH GBB4101G & CHINA'S INSURED SKE8951X & OTHERS
SLB217P,UNKNOWN ON 27/02/2020

Without Prejudice

Dear LKK

Please refer to below email and liaise with third party workshop.

Thank you.

Adeline Chng
Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896178 | F: (65) 6225 5879

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: -4l Taiping 8G

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files fransmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and ma y contain confidential information. Any
wnauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately, Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Janice Chang [mailto:janice@sngahtee.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 3:03 PM

To: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D201082/SKE8951X/ADELINE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH GBB4101G &
CHINA'S INSURED SKE8951X & OTHERS SLB217P,UNKNOWN ON 27/02/2020

Importance: High

Hi,

Please arrange surveyor Xing Guo Qiang to survey this vehicle.
Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin



®

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www. sngahtee.com

-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-

From: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 1:52 PM

To: Janice Chang <janice@sngahtee.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF; SN M20D201082/SKE8951X/ADELINE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH GBB4101G &
CHINA'S INSURED SKE8951X & OTHERS SLB217P,UNKNOWN ON 27/02/2020

Our reference: SNM20D201082C02/ SKE8951X/Chngpw
Your reference: GBB4101G

Dear Janice

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKE8951X & GBB4101G__ ON 27/02/2020

We refer to your email of 03.03.2020.
Please be advice that liability is in favor of your client.
Kindly note the following:-
1. We would like to conduct pre-repair survey of the vehicle at the appointed workshop.

2. We propose the following list of surveyors to be nominated as the Single Joint Expert to conduct
survey of the claimant’s vehicle:-

1. ADRIAN LING 6. KENNETH KONG
2. Kelvin Ang 7. SIMON HO

3. SEE CHEW SENG 8. CHUA WEIJIE

4. MOHD FADHILAH BIN OSMAN 9. MARCUS CHUA
5. XING QUO QIANG 10. HENRY NG

3. If we do not hear from you within two days of this letter, you shall have deemed to have agreed that
the surveyor appointed by us shall be Single Joint Expert for this matter.

4. As per the NIMA Protocol, the survey by our appointed surveyor would include survey of your vehicle
pre-repair, after it is dismantled, and post repairs. Hence, you need to provide us / our surveyors with
the list of items that were damaged and required to be replaced or repaired to facilitate an effective
survey.

5. As stated above, please inform us and our surveyor after the claimant's vehicle had been repaired
so that our surveyor can carry out post repair inspection before the vehicle is returned to your client.
Please co-ordinate with our surveyor immediately after the repair is completed.

If you have any queries, please contact Adeline Chng at 63896155 and email us at
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com




Thank you.

Adeline Chng
Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6178 | F: (65)6225 5879

W: www .sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A& F-4i3s Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information, Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message. either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delefe the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Janice Chang [mailto:janice@sngahtee.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 12:20 PM

To: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D201082/SKE8951X/ADELINE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH GBB4101G &
CHINA'S INSURED SKE8951X & OTHERS SLB217P,UNKNOWN ON 27/02/2020

Importance: High

Hi Adeline,

We refer to the above & wish to check liability for this case.
Hope to hear from you soon.
Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 March 2020 4:58 PM

To: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>; janice@sngahtee.com

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM20D201082/SKE8951X/ADELINE - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH GBB4101G &
CHINA'S INSURED SKE8951X & OTHERS SLB217P,UNKNOWN ON 27/02/2020

Importance: High

Dear Adeline,



Please conduct PRS for GBB4101G.
Note : officer in charge — Adeline 63896155.
*** Kindly quote our reference number when replying.

Thank you,
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896116 | F:(65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: XFJii# Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the
e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Janice Chang <janice@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 3, 2020 12:08 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH GBB4101G & CHINA'S INSURED SKE8951X & OTHERS
SLB217P,UNKNOWN ON 27/02/2020

Importance: High

Hi,

We refer to the above & wish to check liability for this case.
Hope to hear from you soon.
Thank You.

Best Regards

Janice Chang | Senior Admin

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES : 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.-



Used Nissan Urvan Car for Sale in Singapore, Noorjahan Global E... https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/ info.php?ID=876142&DL=36"
]
sGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

New Cars Used Cars Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources
T e

Small But ' | Improve
¥ powerfull k=  Driving
Airgle AG25 | . § | Dynamics &

§ Air Purifier! | =" Performance

3m Shorter
| Wet Braking &
| With Michelin

_] PSS Tyre

Nesan Urvan | [prkeRange | Depresaton

Adva
g seorch ] i
Home # Used Cars » Noorjahan Global Enterprise » Nissan Urvan 3.0M [COE till 07/2024)

: Nissan Urvan 3.0M (COE till 07/2024)

Overvi F 1 A ies Similar Research Photos Map
Price $24,777 Lifespan 24-Aug-2024
Depreciation 5,650 /yr Reg Date 25-Aug-2004
(4yrs 4mths 19days COE left)
Mileage 150,000 km (9.6k fyr) Manufactured | 2004
Road Tax . . N.A. Transmission Manual
Dereg Value ] $12,184 as of today (change) oMV $22,323
COE $13,880 ARF © $1,117
Engine Cap 2953 cc No.of Owners ) 2
Curb Weight 1,500 kg B
Type of Vehicle Wan
Shortiist Compare Add nate
Features Report Error More Actions
View specs of the Nissan Urvan {2008-2009)
Description Seller Information
£0 Driveaway. Monthly Of $648. Van 1s Well Taken Care Of And Well Maintained And Also Its Driven By A Noorjahan Global Enterprise
Mechanic.
10 vehicles for sale. 25 sold in past 3 mths
Category 18 Kaki Bukit Road 3 #03-11
COE Car, Low Milgage Car Entrepreneur Business Centre
Search cars nearhy
Status 2 Ramadan 93669403 @
Available Hassan 90017559 &

Aziz 85333365 &

Car Valuation - Free
Find out the market value of your existing car for free. Get started

m Vehicle Evaluation
e Afraid of lemons? Request to have this car evaluated professionally. Find out more

Posted on: 28-Feb-2020 | Last Updated on: 28-Feb-2020

Upfront Payment » more Financial info
Transfer Fee $25

Down Payment $2,478 (change) Maximurm $0% Loan

1st Instalment $548 Based on 4.5% nterest rate

Insurance You'll also need a valid car insurance to drive
* this vehicle. 18% off with code CAR18
Get a quote now!

$3,051 Check with seler for exact figure

Total Upfront Payment (Without insurance)

Products and Services » Vigw All

Compare

10f2 12/3/2020, 10:04



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 635H
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GBB4101G
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 17 Mar 2020
Vehicle Make: NISSAN

Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:

URVAN PANEL LWB 3.0 5DR 4AT ABS AIRBAG
White

Manufacturing Year: 2008

Engine No.: ZD30209427K
Chassis No.: JNIMG4E25Z0792241
Maximum Power Output: “

Open Market Value: $31,963.00
Original Registration Date: 04 Mar 2009
First Registration Date: 04 Mar 2009
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $1,599.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 29 Feb 2024
COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 5

PQP Paid: $13,688.00
COE Rebate Amount: $10,816.00
Total Rebate Amount: $10,816.00
Message

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period, subject to the statutory lifespan (if applicable) of the vehicle.
The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Mar 2020

OK





